CONTRACT AWARD: UNNAMED ELEMENTARY SCHOOL LOCATED NEAR CONQUISTADOR AND TOMPKINS

BID TABULATION

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT

CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE

1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE
HENDERSON, NV 89074

PROJECT: Unnamed Elementary School Located near Conquistador and Tompkins
MPID NUMBER: 0001615
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER:  SH Architecture
BID DATE February 22, 2018, 1:00 p.m.
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON APRIL 12, 2018
BIDDER BASE BID ALTERNATE # 1 ALTERNATE # 3 ALTERNATE #4 | Base Bid plus ALTERNATE #1, #3 & #4
Including $270,000.00 Allowance | Tunable White Lighting |  Alternate Central Provide Rolling
Fixtures Plant Building Blinds
* Roche Constructors, Inc. * $24,266,700.00 $91,100.00 $34,500.00 $3,200.00 $24,395,500.00
Rafael Construction, Inc. $24,271,914.00 $64,339.00 $64,826.00 $24,255.00 $24,425,334.00
Pace Contracting $24,322,000.00 $68,709.00 $50,280.00 $52,059.00 $24,493,048.00
Sletten Construction of Nevada, Inc. ** $25,150,000.00 $79,854.00 $53.020.00 $50,233.00 $25,333,107.00
Boyd Martin Construction, Inc. ** 25,269,000.00 $72,000.00 $38,000 $3,500.00 $25,382,500.00
** APCO Construction ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted
** Burke Construction Group, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted
** Martin Harris Construction, Inc. **No Bid Submitted **No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted **No Bid Submitted

* APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER
** NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted)




