
CONTRACT AWARD: REPLACEMENT 
J.D. SMITH MIDDLE SCHOOL AND HARTKE PARK 

 
BID TABULATION 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT 

CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE 
1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE 

HENDERSON, NV 89074 
 
 
PROJECT: J.D. Smith Middle School and Hartke Park – Replacement   
MPID NUMBER: 0001616 
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER: Simpson Coulter Studio 
BID DATE March 8, 2018, 1:00 p.m. 
 
 
                       PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON MARCH 22, 2018 

BIDDER         BASE BID 
Including $1,195,000.00 Allowance 

       ALTERNATE # 2 
Manual Roller Shades 

    ALTERNATE # 3 
Tunable White LED 

Fixtures 

    ALTERNATE # 4 
Solid Surface 
Countertops 

Base Bid plus ALTERNATE #2, #3 & #4 

* Martin Harris Construction, Inc. *  $56,348,604.00 $-33,901.00 $201,791.00 $101,921.00 $56,618,415.00 
Sletten Construction of Nevada, Inc.    $57,123,000.00 $-53,530.00 $204,485.00 $49,753.00 $57,323,708.00 

APCO Construction    $59,900,000.00 $78,200.00 $74,000.00 $105,000.00 $60,157,200.00 
**Roche Constructors, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted 

 
 *    APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER 
 ** NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted) 
 
 


