
CONTRACT AWARD: PHASE II OF PHASED REPLACEMENT   
SANDY VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

 
BID TABULATION 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT 

CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE 
1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE 

HENDERSON, NV 89074 
 
PROJECT: Sandy Valley Elementary School – Phase II of Phased Replacement 
MPID NUMBER: 0013434 
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER: LG Architects, Inc. 
BID DATE June 4, 2020, 1:00 p.m. 
 
 
      PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON JULY 9, 2020 

BIDDER                BASE BID 
       (Including $100,000.00 Allowance) 

         Alternate #2 
    Driveway Connection 

       Base Bid plus Alternate #2 

* Benchmark Contracting, Inc. dba 
Cobblestone Construction 

*  $8,352,929.00 * $12,910.00 * $8,365,839.00 

Martin-Harris Construction, Inc.     $8,744,443.00 $16,921.00 $8,761,364.00 

Boyd Martin Construction LLC     $8,834,000.00 $25,800.00 $8,859,800.00 

Rafael Construction, Inc.     $8,849,000.00 $75,900.00 $8,924,900.00 

Sletten Construction of Nevada, Inc.     $9,020,000.00 $20,000.00 $9,040,000.00 

Roche Constructors, Inc.     $9,586,700.00 $20,000.00 $9,606,700.00 

Burke Construction Group, Inc.     $9,559,000.00 $58,000.00 $9,617,000.00 

AF Construction Company     $9,827,000.00 $79,000.00 $9,906,000.00 

CG&B Enterprises, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted 

 
 *    APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER 
 **  NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted) 
 
 


