
CONTRACT AWARD: CLASSROOM BUILDING ADDITION 
DANIEL GOLDFARB ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

 
BID TABULATION 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT 

CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE 
1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE 

HENDERSON, NV 89074 
 
 
PROJECT: Daniel Goldfarb Elementary School – Classroom Building Addition 
MPID NUMBER: 0013857 
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER: Ethos Three Architecture 
BID DATE September 11, 2018, 10:00 a.m. 
 

PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON THURSDAY, OCTOBER 18, 2018 

BIDDER         Alternate # 1             BASE BID       Base Bid plus Alternative 

* Rafael Construction, Inc. $20,000.00 *  $11,183,185.00          *  $11,203,185.00 

Benchmark Contracting, Inc. dba Cobblestone Construction $17,500.00     $11,749,000.00             $11,766,500.00 

Roche Constructors, Inc. $8,500.00     $11,845,700.00             $11,854,200.00 

Burke Construction Group, Inc. $17,266.00     $11,918,456.00             $11,935,722.00 

Martin Harris Construction $17,112.00    $11,957,440.00             $11,974,552.00 

** Boyd Martin Construction, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted     ** No Bid Submitted 

 
 *    APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER 
 **   NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted) 
 
 


