CONTRACT AWARD: CLASSROOM BUILDING ADDITION AND MODERNIZATION AT C.H. DECKER ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID TABULATION
CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT
CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE
1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE
HENDERSON, NV 89074

PROJECT: C.H. Decker Elementary School — Classroom Building Addition and Modernization
MPID NUMBER: 0014119
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER: Gensler Architecture Design & Planning, P.C.
BID DATE July 16, 2019, 1 p.m.
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON AUGUST 22, 2019
BIDDER Alternate # 1 Alternate # 2 BASE BID BASE BID

(Diesel-Drive Centrifugal Fire Pump)

(Alternate Offsite Improvements)

(Including $550,000.00 Allowance)

(Including $550,000.00 allowance and alternates)

* Benchmark Contracting, Inc. dba Cobblestone Construction *$84,000.00 *$98,000.00 *$12,506,000.00 * $12,688,000.00
Burke Construction Group, Inc. $155,252.00 $149,239.00 $12,762,000.00 $13,066,491.00
Martin Harris Construction, Inc. $119,605.00 $126,825.00 $13,150,700.00 $13,397,130.00
Rafael Construction, Inc. $125,000.00 $145,000.00 $13,417,000.00 $13,687,000.00
Boyd Martin Construction, Inc. $114,000.00 $83,000.00 $13,674,000.00 $13,871,000.00
Roche Constructors, Inc. $113,000.00 $87,000.00 $13,878,700.00 $14,078,700.00
AF Construction Company $136,000.00 $411,000.00 $14,167,000.00 $14,714,000.00
**Affordable Concepts, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted
** Sletten Construction of Nevada ** No Bid Submitted **No Bid Submitted **No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted

* APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER

** NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted)




