
CONTRACT AWARD: CLASROOM BUILDING ADDITION AND MODERNIZATION   
FRANK LAMPING ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

 
BID TABULATION 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT 

CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE 
1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE 

HENDERSON, NV 89074 
 
PROJECT: Frank Lamping Elementary School – Classroom Building Addition and Modernization 
MPID NUMBER: 0014120 
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER: Gensler Architecture, Design & Planning, P.C. 
BID DATE June 20, 2019, 1 p.m. 
  
                                      PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON AUGUST 8, 2019  

 
 *    APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER 
 **   NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (Did Not Meet Statutory Requirement) 
 *** NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted) 
 
 

BIDDER Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #4       BASE BID Base Bid plus Alternates 
* Burke Construction Group, Inc. * $118,619.00 * $67,534.00 * $332,237.00 *  $13,025,183.00              * $13,543,573.00 

Rafael Construction, Inc.   $135,000.00     $119,000.00   $500,000.00     $13,390,000.00 $14,144,000.00 
Benchmark Contracting, Inc. dba Cobblestone Construction $99,598.00   $61,458.00   $308,500.00     $13,612,175.00 $14,081,731.00 

AF Construction Company  $128,225.00  $86,250.00   $436,195.00     $14,397,000.00 $15,047,670.00 
** Martin-Harris Construction, Inc.        ** $122,155.00        ** $53,665.00       ** $215,440.00             ** $13,628,772.00             ** $14,020,032.00 

 ***Affordable Concepts, Inc. *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted 
*** Boyd Martin Construction, LLC *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted 

*** Roche Constructors, Inc. *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted *** No bid Submitted *** No bid Submitted 


