
CONTRACT AWARD: REPLACE MYRTLE TATE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 
 

BID TABULATION 
CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 

OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT 
CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE 

1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE 
HENDERSON, NV 89074 

 
 
PROJECT: Myrtle Tate Elementary School – Replacement 
PROJECT NUMBER: 0001627 
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER: Simpson Coulter Studio 
BID DATE: March 5, 2020, 1 p.m. 

 
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL MAY 7, 2020 

BIDDER            BASE BID 
(Including $1,000,000.00 Allowance) 

            Alternate 1 
(Play Structures & Playground 

Protective Surfacing) 

      Alternate 2 
(Shade Structures) 

 
Base Bid Amount plus Alternates  

* Roche Constructors, Inc. *  $31,567,700.00 $325,000.00 $130,000.00 $32,022,700.00 

Martin-Harris Construction, Inc. $31,591,246.00 $282,639.00 $102,252.00 $31,976,137.00 

Rafael Construction, Inc. $32,690,000.00 $345,500.00 $155,000.00 $33,190,000.00 

Sletten Construction of Nevada, Inc. $32,679,000.00 $368,872.00 $235,642.00  $33,283,514.00 

** Burke Construction Group, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted  

 
 *    APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER 
 **   NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted) 
 
 


