CONTRACT AWARD: MANUEL J. CORTEZ ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

CLASSROOM BUILDING ADDITION AND MODERNIZATION

BID TABULATION
CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT
CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE
1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE

HENDERSON, NV 89074

PROJECT: Manuel J. Cortez Elementary School — Classroom Building Addition and Modernization
MPID NUMBER: 0014118
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER: Gensler Architecture Design & Planning, P.C.
BID DATE: July 16, 2019, 10 a.m.
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON AUGUST 22, 2019.
BIDDER Alternate # 1 Alternate #3 BASE BID BASE BID
(Diesel-Drive Centrifugal Fire Pump) (Temporary Chiller) (Including $550,000.00 Allowance) | (Including $550,000.00 Allowance and Alternates)
* Rafael Construction, Inc.
$122,500.00 $59,000.00 $13,249,000.00 * $13,430,500.00
Burke Construction Group, Inc. $100,206.00 $48,170.00 $13,280,000.00 $13,428,376.00
Benchmark Contracting, Inc., dba Cobblestone Construction $108,143.00 $48,484.00 $13,437,000.00 $13,593,627.00
Martin Harris Construction, Inc. $113,000.00 $87,000.00 $13,441,900.00 $13,641,900.00
Boyd Martin Construction, LLC $104,000.00 $46,000.00 $13,484,000.00 $13,634,000.00
Roche Constructors, Inc. $102,000.00 $46,000.00 $13,976,000.00 $14,124,000.00
** AF Construction Company **No Bid Submitted **No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted
** Affordable Concepts, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted
** Sletten Construction of Nevada, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted **No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted **No Bid Submitted

* APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER
** NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted)




