
CONTRACT AWARD: INSTALL BOLLARDS   
VARIOUS LOCATIONS 

 
BID TABULATION 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT 

CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE 
1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE 

HENDERSON, NV 89074 
 
 
PROJECT: Install Bollards – Various Locations 
MPID NUMBER: 0014286 
BID DATE March 21, 2019, 1 p.m. 
        PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON APRIL 25, 2019 

BIDDER          BASE BID Alternate 1 
     (Cyril Wengert ES) 

            Alternate 2 
(Elizabeth Wilhelm ES) 

              Total Base Bid  
                 w/ Alternates 

* CG&B Enterprises, Inc.                  *  $216,000.00 $29,000.00 $33,000.00 $278,000.00 

Maile, Inc., dba Maile Concrete $303,183.00 $29,008.25 $40,237.25 $372,428.50 

Las Vegas Paving Corporation  $349,000.00      $42,000.00 $55,000.00 $446,000.00 

** Rafael Construction, Inc.                  ** $260,345.00 $44,514.00 $27,381.00 $332,240.00 

 *** Cleveland Construction & Design, LLC *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted   *** No Bid Submitted           *** No Bid Submitted 

 *** Mikon Construction, Inc. *** No Bid Submitted *** No Bid Submitted   *** No Bid Submitted           *** No Bid Submitted 

 
 *    APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER 
 **   NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (Did Not Meet Statutory Requirement) 
 *** NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted) 
 
 


