CONTRACT AWARD: REPLACEMENT
JO MACKEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

BID TABULATION
CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OPERATIONAL SERVICES UNIT
CONTRACTS, PROCUREMENT, AND COMPLIANCE

1180 MILITARY TRIBUTE PLACE
HENDERSON, NV 89074

PROJECT: Jo Mackey Elementary School, Academy of Leadership and Global Communication — Elementary School Replacement
MPID NUMBER: 0001624-2
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER:  Gensler Architecture, Design and Planning, P.C.
BID DATE June 25, 2019, 1 p.m.
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON AUGUST 8, 2019
BIDDER ALTERNATE 1 ALTERNATE 2 ALTERNATE 3 ALTERNATE #4 BASE BID BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATES
* Martin-Harris Construction, Inc. $59,649.00 $59,649.00 $89,937.00 $198,085.00 * $29,756,600.00 $30,163,920.00
APCO Construction $48,843.00 $37,989.00 $46,260.00 $309,600.00 $30,600,000.00 $31,042,692.00
Rafael Construction, Inc. $91,500.00 $91,500.00 $65,000.00 $350,000.00 $30,979,563.00 $31,577,563.00
Roche Constructors, Inc. $83,000.00 $83,000.00 $40,000.00 $183,000.00 $31,578,700.00 $31,967,700.00
** AF Construction Company ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted, ** No Bid Submitted| ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted
** Burke Construction Group, Inc. ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted] ** No Bid Submitted| ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted
** Sletten Construction of Nevada, Inc. | ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted | ** No Bid Submitted| ** No Bid Submitted| ** No Bid Submitted ** No Bid Submitted

* APPARENT LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID/BIDDER
** NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER (No Bid Submitted)




